
(AFI) ANP, VOLUME II 

  

PART II – AERODROMES / AERODROME OPERATIONS (AOP) 

  

1.       INTRODUCTION 
  

1.1                   This part of the (AFI) ANP, Volume II, complements the provisions in ICAO Standards, Recommended Practices and 
Procedures (SARPs) related to aerodrome design and operations (AOP). It contains dynamic plan elements related to the assignment of 

responsibilities to States for the provision of AOP facilities and services within a specified area in accordance with Article 28 of the 

Convention on International Civil Aviation (Doc 7300); and mandatory requirements related to AOP facilities and services to be 
implemented by States in accordance with regional air navigation agreements.  Such agreement indicates a commitment on the part of the 

State(s) concerned to implement the requirement(s) specified. 

  
  

2.       GENERAL REGIONAL REQUIREMENTS 
  

2.1                    Table AOP II-1 contains the list of facilities and services to be provided by the State concerned at each aerodrome that is 

listed in Table AOP I-1 in Volume I. Table AOP II-1 shows the operational requirements at each aerodrome to be considered in planning 

the facilities and services for safe and efficient aircraft operations. 
  

Visual aids for low visibility aerodrome operations 

  
2.2                    At aerodromes where there is a requirement to conduct low visibility operations, the appropriate visual and non-visual aids 

should be provided. 

  
Non-precision approach aids 

  
2.3                    Where required by the topographic and/or environmental situation of an aerodrome, improved track guidance during 

departure and/or approach by specific non-visual and/or visual aids should be provided even if such aids would not normally be required in 

accordance with the SARPs. 
  

Reduced runway declared distances for take-off 

  

Note. — In the following operational requirements the term “intersection” is used to cover both intersection and junction concepts. 

  

2.4                   The reduced runway declared distances for take-off, as for those used for full runway declared distances, should consist of 
take-off run available (TORA), take-off distance available (TODA) and accelerate-stop distance available (ASDA). 

  

2.5                   The datum-line from which the reduced runway declared distances for take-off should be determined is defined by the 
intersection of the downwind edge of the specific taxiway with the runway edge. The loss, if any, of runway length due to alignment of the 

aircraft prior to take-off should be taken into account by the operators for the calculation of the aircraft’s take-off weight.  

  
2.6                   Intersections used as intermediate take-off positions should be identified by the “taxiway designator” to which the datum-line 

of the associated reduced runway declared distance for take-off refers. 

  
2.7                  At each international aerodrome, specific minima visibility for take-off should be established, regulating the use of 

intersection take-off positions. These minima should permit the appropriate ATC unit to maintain a permanent surveillance of the ground 

movement operations, and the flight crews to constantly secure their position on the manoeuvring area, so as to exclude any potential risk of 
confusion as to the identification of the aircraft and intersections used for take-off. The minima should be consistent with the surface 

movement guidance and control system (SMGCS) provided at the aerodrome concerned. 

  
2.8                   The provision of marking and lighting aids together with signs should ensure the safe control and guidance of aircraft towards 

and at take-off intersections appropriate to the minima visibility criteria retained. At the runway holding position of the associated 

intersection take-off position, such signs should indicate the runway heading and the remaining TORA in metres.  
  

2.9                   At aerodromes regularly used by international commercial air transport, take-offs from runway/taxiway intersections may be 

justified for the following reasons:  
  

a)      runway capacity improvement;  

b)     taxi routes distances reduction;  
c)      noise alleviation; and  

d)     air pollution reduction. 

  
2.10                   The appropriate authorities should, upon prior consultation with aircraft operators, agree on the selection of suitable 

intermediate intersection take-off positions along the runway(s). Accordingly, authorities should determine the reduced runway declared 

distances for take-off associated with each selected intersection take-off position and establish the specific ATC rules and operational 
procedures/limitations. Such provisions should be published in the State aeronautical information publications (AIP). 

  

Aerodrome capacity management 
  

2.11                 As an integral part of the air navigation system, the aerodrome should provide the needed ground infrastructure including, 

inter alia, lighting; taxiways; runway, including exits; aprons and precise surface guidance to improve safety and to maximize aerodrome 
capacity in all weather conditions. An efficient aerodrome capacity planning and management should include: 

  



a)      reduction of runway occupancy time; 

b)     the capability to safely manoeuvre in all weather conditions whilst maintaining capacity; 
c)      precise surface guidance to and from a runway required in all conditions; and 

d)     availability of information on the position (to an appropriate level of accuracy) and intent of all vehicles and aircraft operating on the 

movement area for the appropriate ATM community members. 
  

2.12                 States should ensure that adequate consultation and, where appropriate, cooperation between airport authorities and 

users/other involved parties are implemented at all international aerodromes to satisfy the provisions of aerodrome capacity assessment and 
requirement. 

  

2.13                 When international aerodromes are reaching designed operational capacity, a better and more efficient utilization of existing 
runways, taxiways and aprons is required. Runway selection procedures and standard taxi routes at aerodromes should ensure an optimum 

flow of air traffic with a minimum of delay and a maximum use of available capacity. They should also, if possible, take account of the need 

to keep taxiing times for arriving and departing aircraft as well as apron occupancy time to a minimum. The airport collaborative decision 
making (A-CDM) concept should be implemented to improve airport capacity as early as possible. 

  

Aerodrome capacity assessment and requirement 

  

2.14                 The declared capacity/demand condition at aerodromes should be periodically reviewed in terms of a qualitative analysis for 

each system component and, when applicable, the result of the qualitative assessment upon mutual agreement be used for information. 
  

2.15                 The future capacity/demand, based on a forecast for the next five years, should be agreed upon after close cooperation 

between aerodrome authorities and affected users.  
  

2.16                 Operators should consult with aerodrome authorities when future plans indicate a significant increased requirement for 

capacity resulting in one of the elements reaching a limiting condition.  
  

2.17                 Aerodrome capacity should be assessed by aerodrome authorities in consultation with the parties involved for each 
component (terminal/apron/aircraft operations) using agreed methods and criteria for level of delays.  

  

2.18                 Where restrictions in aerodrome capacity are identified, a full range of options for their reduction or removal should be 
evaluated by the aerodrome authority, in close cooperation with the operators and other involved parties. Such options should include 

technical/operational/procedural and environmental improvements and facility expansion. 

  

2.19                 At many aerodromes, airspace capacity has influence on the aerodrome capacity. If the declared capacity of a specified 

airspace has influence on aerodrome operations, this should be indicated and action undertaken to reach a capacity in this airspace 

corresponding to the aerodrome capacity. 
  

2.20                 The possibility of overcoming capacity limitations should also take the use of other aerodromes in the vicinity into 

consideration.  
  

Closure of regular aerodromes 

  
2.21                 When a regular aerodrome is to be closed, States should ensure that sufficient alternate aerodromes remain open to provide 

for the safety and efficiency of aircraft approaching the regular aerodrome that may be required to divert to an alternate. 

  
Scheduling aerodrome maintenance 

  

2.22                 States, when planning major aerodrome maintenance work that would affect the regularity of international aircraft operations, 
should consider the need to notify aircraft operators sufficiently in advance prior to undertaking the scheduled work. 

  

  

3.       SPECIFIC REGIONAL REQUIREMENTS 
  

3.1                   TBD (if required). 
  

  

TABLE AOP II-1 — REQUIREMENTS AND CAPACITY ASSESSMENT 
  
EXPLANATION OF THE TABLE 
   

   
Note:  Columns 3 to 5 for physical characteristics relate to runways and taxiways. The physical characteristics of taxiways and aprons 

should be compatible with the aerodrome reference code (Column 3) and appropriate for the runways with which they are related. 

  
  

Column   

1 Name of the city and aerodrome, preceded by the location indicator. 

  Note 1— When the aerodrome is located on an island and no particular city or town is served by the aerodrome, the name of the island is 
included instead of a city. 

https://portal.icao.int/space/ANP/Documents/AFI/FASID%20Table%20AOP%20II-1.docx


  Designation of the aerodrome as: 

RS — international scheduled air transport, regular use; 

RNS — international non-scheduled air transport, regular use; 

AS — international scheduled air transport, alternate use; and 

ANS — international non-scheduled air transport, alternate use. 

2 Required rescue and firefighting service (RFF). The required level of protection expressed by means of an aerodrome RFF category 
number, in accordance with Annex 14, Volume I, 9.2. 

3 Aerodrome reference code (RC). The aerodrome reference code for aerodrome characteristics expressed in accordance with Annex 14, 
Volume I, chapter 1. The code letter or number within an element selected for design purposes is related to the critical aeroplane 
characteristics for which the facilities are provided. 

4 Runway Designation numbers 

5 Type of each of the runways to be provided. The types of runways, as defined in Annex 14, Volume I, Chapter 1, are: 

NINST — non-instrument runway; 

NPA — non-precision approach runway; 

PA1 — precision approach runway, Category I; 

PA2 — precision approach runway, Category II; 

PA3 — precision approach runway, Category III. 

6 Remarks. This column is for other information including critical design aircraft selected for determining RC, critical aircraft selected for 
determining the RFF category and critical aircraft for pavement strength. Only one critical aircraft type is shown if it is used to determine 
all the above three elements: otherwise different critical aircraft types need to be shown for different elements. 
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